








Owner PID Case 
ADDRESS 

(Mail) 
ATD? NOTES 

BOYD JENNIFER 4180000 126 

401 TOM 
LANDRY HWY 
#660901 

Jordan 
Rubin 

The appellant’s agent referred to the four 
comparable sales. Comparable sale 2 and 4 are 
in the subject property’s neighborhood, 102. 
These properties are all similar square footage 
and sold close to the assessment date.  

HUTCHISON 
RALPH C & 
HUTCHISON 
CAROL S 
TRUSTEES 96158788 132 

401 TOM 
LANDRY HWY 
#660901 

Jordan 
Rubin 

The appellant’s agent referred to three 
comparable sales that are located within 1/3 of 
a mile from the subject property. Adjusted sale 
prices for these comparable sales range from 
$561,335 to $645,103 with an average adjusted 
value of $622,343. 

AL-ZUGHIR HANI 
& ABDALSHAH 
DAJLAH 986053323 139 

401 TOM 
LANDRY HWY 
#660901 

Jordan 
Rubin 

The appellant’s agent referred to his four 
comparable sales located within ½ a mile from 
the subject property. These properties are 
similar square footage and sold in 2023. After 
adjustments, their values range from $719,572 
to $795,192 with an average adjusted value of 
$768,315. 

FKR PROPERTIES 
LLC 165174005 85 

14400 
METCALF AVE 

Reed Frizell 

The appellant presented their income approach 
utilizing a loaded capitalization rate of 8.9%. 
The average for capitalization rates in the area 
in 2023 was 8.2%, and the agent presented a 
CoStar report showing a trend of increases in 
capitalization rates for this market. The 
appellant referred to a CoStar Comparable 
Lease summary with 8 properties all located 
near the subject property. The appellant used a 
10% vacancy in their calculations, but the 
average vacancy for Quarter 4 in 2023 was 
28%.  

 
Updated their opinion of value to $17,620,000 

 


